Jasmina Farkas

From: prince_guna@hotmail.com

Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 3:17 PM
To: Jasmina Farkas

Subject: Re: FW: Avia 2902 5th deposit cheque

Please shred it.

Thanks,
Gunasekar

On Jan. 20, 2021 3:01 p.m., Jasmina Farkas <jasmina@lifeatparkside.com> wrote:

Good afternoon,

As per our telephone conversation please advise if you would like to pick up this CHQ or if you would like me to shred
it.

To remind you this cheque was returned to our office because the numerical amount did not correspond the amount
written out on the cheque. You have replaced this deposit.

Thank you.

Kind regards,
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