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Jasmina Farkas

From: LT Savasta <ltsavasta@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 3:36 PM
To: Jasmina Farkas
Subject: Savasta - Mississauga Parkside Condo

Hello Jasmina, 
 
I am sorry I missed your call today.  I am writing in regards to the deposit cheque that is on our file. Susanne 
Masstromatie is our niece and it is fine to go ahead and shred the cheque showing on file. I have checked our 
files and noted that we had sent a replacement cheque for the deposit and that it has been cashed.  
 
Please note for your records that our email address is LTSavasta@gmail.com.  I believe you may have and i 
instead of an L.  
 
If you need anything else, please do not hesitate to contact us.  
 
Best regards, 
 
Linda Savasta 
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Jasmina Farkas

From: Jasmina Farkas
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 2:07 PM
To: itsavasta@gmail.com; nicholas.savasta.ns@gmail.com
Subject: AVIA 2 3108 extra deposit CHQ

Good afternoon, 
 
I tried reaching you by phone and left voicemail for Linda. I am reviewing your file and found a deposit CHQ for this unit 
but in a different name with a note that deposit CHQ would be replaced.  
The CHQ is in the amount of $5000 and issued by ***Mastromattei. Please advise if you are familiar with this person and 
if you would like to pick the cheque up or if you agree that I shred it. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Kind regards, 
 
JASMINA FARKAS 
SITE ADMINISTRATOR 
 

 
 
465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  
T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 

LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 
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Jasmina Farkas

From: Jasmina <farkas.b.jasmina@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 4:41 PM
To: Jasmina Farkas
Subject: Chq

 

 
 
 
Sent from my iPhone 
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