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Jasmina Farkas

From: Jasmina Farkas
Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 4:13 PM
To: 6690220@gmail.com
Cc: Parkside Village Sales
Subject: RE: AVIA #707 (previously #706) old deposit CHQ

Good afternoon, 
 
I have just left this cheque in the office so you can pick it up at your most convenient time. 
 
Jasmina 
 
 
From: Fouad Dib (Fred) [mailto:6690220@gmail.com]  
Sent: Thursday, January 21, 2021 12:09 PM 
To: Jasmina Farkas <jasmina@lifeatparkside.com> 
Cc: Parkside Village Sales <sales@lifeatparkside.com> 
Subject: RE: AVIA #707 (previously #706) old deposit CHQ 
 
Good Morning Jasmine, 
 
Appreciate if you leave it at the office in my name, in the first occasion to see Allen, will take it from him. 
The client asked me many times for it. 
 
Best Regards 
Fred Dib (Fouad) 
Broker of Record 
Certified Negotiation Expert 
ABR, CRS, SRES, ASA, IRES,  E-PRO 
Residential, Commercial, Investments and Mortgages 
CITYVIEW Realty Inc., Brokerage 
525 Curran Pl, Mississauga L5B 0H4 
www.cityviewrealty.ca 
info@freddib.com 
Cell   : (416) 669.0220 
Office: (905) 363.1943 
Fax   : (905) 752.9909 
 

From: Jasmina Farkas <jasmina@lifeatparkside.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, January 20, 2021 2:45 PM 
To: 6690220@gmail.com 
Cc: Parkside Village Sales <sales@lifeatparkside.com> 
Subject: AVIA #707 (previously #706) old deposit CHQ 
 
Good afternoon, 
 
This deposit was replaced by I still have the old CHQ, as per attachment. Shall I return it to you or shall I shred it? 
Please advise. 
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Thank you.  
 
Kind regards, 
 
JASMINA FARKAS 
SITE ADMINISTRATOR 
 

 
 
465 BURNHAMTHORPE ROAD WEST 
MISSISSAUGA, ON L5B 0E3  
T. 905.273.9333 | F. 905.273.7772 

LIFEATPARKSIDE.COM 
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