210-1455 Youville Drive
Orleans, On K1C 627

Valecraft ™™

Homes Ltd.

PO0048862

Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
SCOTT BERWICK STAIRS INC. Site: DEERFIELD VILLAGE PHASE 2
1191 PILON ROAD Lot/Unit: BLOCK F-34 & H-46
CLARENCE CREEK, ON KOA 1NO Model:
Civic: DEARBORN PRIVATE
tel: 6138353579
fax: (613) 835-3892
contactt SCOTT
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Aug 06, 2020 ARIEL S18 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE D ipti ary UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
escription ORDERED
042-F34-680 680 #9, 10 S/l OAK NOSING AT BASEMENT STAIR 1.0000 60.000000 60.00
OPENING LEDGE
042-H46-680 680 #10, 11 S/l OAK NOSING AT BASEMENT STAIR 1.0000 60.000000 60.00
OPENING LEDGE
2 ¥ Subtotal 120.00
- C/M i/"’/ /\ HST 15.60
Authorized Sidh\aﬁlre(‘ Total Order Value 135.60
ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS
1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.
4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.
5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.
6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

WHITE - ORIGINAL CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE PINK - DEPARTMENT



Scott Berwick Stairs Inc.

1191 Pilon Road, Clarence Creek, On.  K0OA INO Tel: (613) 488-2905 Fax: (613) 488-2909
July 31, 2020
Deerfield D18
o Upgrade StAIr t0 08K ..ovvvveeerrieiririereriiricinieres oot esee s ea st b e b ssss et en $2,480.00
epPEerfetd 33~
sem=pradetotraditiondpostsamdespircies (APl N . ..., 536180~
Deerfield H46
* S/Textra 5’ of nosing with stain/finish on 1€dge .........o.cceeceienrenviriniinccnniecsenns $ 60.00
Deetfield F34 iR ESSREEE S
e S/l extra 5’ of nosing with stain/finish on I€dge .......ccccceverreviecniviicieiee s $ 60.00
REAR. BASEMENT STAIRS
Rathwell J59
e As per contract Extras for Model 110:
S/T oak wide nosing With finish ........c.ccviiviiiiviinic s $ 407.00
Rathwell 280
*  S/I garage rail with spindles 2 SIAES ....co.veciverririiiieiiiicicc e $ 177.00
Rathwell 259 _
e S/I garage rail with spindles 2 sides ........c.ccoerven.. S $ 177.00
Rathwell 258
* S/I garage rail with Spindles 2 SIAES ......covuvvreriiviiriiciee e eseereaes $ 177.00
Rathwell 250
* S/1 garage rail with Spindles 2 SIdeS .....coviiniiiiiriniieniicceee e eeseese e $ 177.00
Rathwell 282
e S/I garage rail with Spindles 2 SIAES ....ccovuririrriiiieiiiie e eere s are s $ 177.00
Rathwell 283
*  S/I garage rail with Spindles 2 SIAES ...vuiiviviiiiriceiiiiieeceeeee e seeersseesesssesesesssssesones $ 177.00
Rathwell 303

* S/I garage rail with Spindles 2 SIAES ...ceuivveiiirerrireeeeieeeeeee oo oo, $ 177.00



Purchase Orders

From: Linda Berwick <Iberwick.scottberwickstairs@outlook.com>
Sent: Tuesday, August 4, 2020 11:07 AM

To: Purchase Orders

Subject: FW: PO REQUEST - July 2020 + 319 for garage rail2 sides
Attachments: CCF_000397.pdf

Hi Ariel,

Can you add Rathwell 319 for the garage rail spindles (2) sides: $177.00.
It was inmy list of June, but | can not find it on the portal.
Thank you, Linda

i @
y > !

From: Linda Berwick

Sent: August 3, 2020 5:01 PM

To: Purchase Orders (PO@valecraft.com) <PO@valecraft.com>

Subject: PO REQUEST - July 2020

Hi Ariel,

Please find purchase order request for July 2020.

Also | just wanted to mention to you, that all the halfwall delete for the great room and for the 2" floor are now listed in
the contract. | have not corrected the amounts on the po’s that were already issued but going forward it would be

great if contract prices would be used.

Thanks, Linda

**¥* Due to the quantity of emails that we received, we ask that you call the office at 613 488 2905 to schedule
appointments, confirm orders and any questions regarding your file. ***

Linda Berwick, B.Comm

Tel: 613 488-2905
Fax: 613 488 2909
www.scottberwickstairs.com




