Valecraft Homes (2019) Limited Purchase Order PO0000467
210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
SILVA ET ST-PIERRE LTEE Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 3
600 RUE VERNON, LOCAL "B" Lot/Unit: LOT 10
GATINEAU, QC' 9] 3K5 Model: 825 STANDARD
Civic: 537 STRASBOURG STREET
tel: 8197770347
fax: (819) 777-1729
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Aug 25, 2020 ARIEL S28 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
o QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
064-010-650 CODE 650 RE & RE BSMT. WINDOW FROM 56"x24" TO 1.0000 350.000000 350.00
56"x30"
B ,_74'— - Subtotal 350.00
7 — /
V// 5// /( HST 45.50
Authorized Siqﬁ'ature Total Order Value 395.50

3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.

6. No deliveries accepted after4:00 pm or on weekends.

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.

4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




Purchase Orders

From: Kirk Richards

Sent: Tuesday, August 25, 2020 3:17 PM
To: Purchase Orders

Cc: Jeff Jasmann

Subject: Re: Request for Po

Afternoon

Has this Po been issued?
Thank you,

Kirk Richards 613-868-3104
krichards@valecraft.com

Place St. Thomas(Embrun)
Valecraft Homes (2019)Limited

On Aug 12, 2020, at 3:29 PM, Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com> wrote:
Avriel,

Can you go ahead and write up the Po

Thank you,

Kirk Richards 613-868-3104
krichards@valecraft.com

Place St. Thomas(Embrun)
Valecraft Homes (2019)Limited

Begin forwarded message:

From: Sstp Silva St-Pierre <sstp@silvastpierre.com>
Date: August 12, 2020 at 2:36:49 PM EDT

To: Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>
Subject: RE: Request for Po

$350.00 PLUS TAXES

De : Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>
Envoyé : 12 ao(t 2020 09:35

A : Sstp Silva St-Pierre <Sstp@silvastpierre.com>
Cc : Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>
Objet : Re: Request for Po

Morning



How much for the box only with glass.
Thank you,

Kirk Richards 613-868-3104
krichards@valecraft.com

Place St. Thomas(Embrun)
Valecraft Homes (2019)Limited

On Aug 11, 2020, at 1:42 PM, Sstp Silva St-Pierre
<sstp @silvastpierre.com> wrote:

KIRK,I'M STILL WAITING FOR THE PO

De : Kirk Richards <krichards@valecraft.com>

Envoyé : 4 aolt 2020 14:10

A : Sstp Silva St-Pierre <Sstp@silvastpierre.com>; Purchase Orders
<PO@valecraft.com>

Cc : Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>; Victor Hoang
<vhoang@valecraft.com>; Jeff Jasmann <jjasmann@valecraft.com>
Objet : Request for Po

Afternoon

Lot 10 pst3
Wrong basement was installed, please provide a price to re&re of
basement window from a 5624 to a 5630.

Thank you,

Kirk Richards 613-868-3104
krichards@valecraft.com

Place St. Thomas(Embrun)
Valecraft Homes (2019)Limited




