Valecraft = ™

Homes (2019) Limited

210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104

Vendor: Ship To:
FIREPLACE CENTER & PATIO SHOP Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 6
1722 CARLING AVENUE Lot/Unit: LOT 2
OTTAWA, ONTARIO K2A 1C7 Model: 826 STANDARD
Civic: 704 NAMUR STREET
tel: 6137281775
fax:
contact:
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Dec 15, 2022 ARIEL F10 NET 30 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
ipti o UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED
066-002-232 CODE 232 FIREPLACE COMMISSION 1.0000 95.000000 95.00
A 7 /i Subtotal 95.00
////"Z\C(\ HST 12.35
L. Authorized Signature Total Order Value 107.35

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS
1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.
4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, flood, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.
6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.
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Purchase Orders

From: Alex Beckett

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 8:57 AM
To: Purchase Orders

Subject: FW: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Ph6

$95.00 for fireplace commissioning @ Lot 2 PST6.

Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

) Valecraft

Homes Ltd,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210
Orleans, On K1C 627

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 219
Mobile: 613-868-8403
www.valecraft.com

From: Leslie Emmerson <leslieemmerson@fireplacecenter.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 8:22 AM

To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Cc: Daniel Guerin <dguerin@valecraft.com>; Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>; 'Lewis Pelicos'
<LPelicos@fireplacecenter.com>; Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>

Subject: RE: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Ph6

HI Alex,

Thank you for getting back to me so quickly, Sounds good, the cost is $95.00+HST

Thanks Leslie

CLOSED DEC 26™ AND RE OPEN JAN 2P 2023

Leslie Emmerson

New Construction Installation Coordinator
The Fireplace Center & Patio Shop

1722 Carling Ave

Ottawa Ont, K2A 1C7

(O) 613-728-7037 EXT 652

(C) 613-880-4216



s

CELEBRATING

From: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>

Sent: December-14-22 8:16 AM

To: 'Leslie Emmerson' <Jeslieemmerson@fireplacecenter.com>

Cc: Daniel Guerin <dguerin@valecraft.com>; Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>
Subject: RE: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Ph6

He Leslie, Ariel is off sick today. We will provide a PO when he is back in office.
Can you confirm the cost to commission the fireplace please?

Thanks
Alex Beckett
Architectural Manager

&) Valecraft

S Homes Lud,

1455 Youville Drive, Suite 210

Orleans, On K1C 827

Tel: 613-837-1104 Ext. 219

Mobile: 613-868-8403
hitps://link.edgepilot.com/s/e2307181/4iS820ccgkS41Hem1pbTcg?u=http://www.valecraft.com/

From: Daniel Guerin <dguerin@valecraft.com>
Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 7:22 AM
To: Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>
Subject: Fw: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Ph6

Hi Alex
Can you please reply to Leslie
thanks

Dan

From: Leslie Emmerson <|eslieemmerson@fireplacecenter.com>

Sent: Wednesday, December 14, 2022 6:48 AM

To: Daniel Guerin <dguerin@valecraft.com>; Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>; Purchase Orders
<PO@valecraft.com>

Cc: 'Lewis Pelicos' <LPelicos@fireplacecenter.com>

Subject: RE: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Ph6




Hi,
The commissioning was completed yesterday, | need a PO to invoice this?

Thanks

CLOSED DEC 26™ AND RE OPEN JAN 2N° 2023

Leslie Emmerson

New Construction Installation Coordinator
The Fireplace Center & Patio Shop

1722 Carling Ave

Ottawa Ont, K2A 1C7

(O) 613-728-7037 EXT 652

(C) 613-880-4216

CELEBRATING

From: Daniel Guerin <dguerin@valecraft.com>

Sent: December-09-22 8:52 AM

To: Leslie Emmerson <LeslieEmmerson@fireplacecenter.com>; Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>; Purchase
Orders <PQ@valecraft.com>

Cc: Lewis Pelicos <LPelicos@fireplacecenter.com>

Subject: Re: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Phé

Hi Leslie

We will look into this on Monday for you

From: Leslie Emmerson <LeslieEmmerson@fireplacecenter.com>

Sent: Friday, December 9, 2022 8:39 AM

To: Roger Brunet <rbrunet@valecraft.com>; Alex Beckett <abeckett@valecraft.com>; Daniel Guerin
<dguerin@valecraft.com>; Purchase Orders <PO@valecraft.com>

Cc: Lewis Pelicos <LPelicos@fireplacecenter.com>

Subject: Commissioning STP Lot 2 Ph6

Hi

The site is requesting commissioning for this lot on Tuesday. How do 1 get a PO for this? $95.00+HST and will there be
a completion slip uploaded for this?

Thanks



