“ “ 7 1 [‘t Purchase Order P0O0002746
Homes (2019) Limited
210-1455 Youville Drive
Ottawa, On K1C 627
Phone: 613-837-1104
Vendor: Ship To:
DALMEN PRODUCTS LTD Site: PLACE ST. THOMAS PHASE 7
5630 ST-CATHERINE STREET Lot/Unit: BLOCK B06
PO BOX 220
Model: 160-2 STANDARD
SFISIBORE, CRIARIO NIG2E0 Civic: 940 COLOGNE STREET
tel: 613-524-2268
fax:
contact: MARC BELLEFEUILLE info@dalmen.com
ORDER DATE CHG. ORDER DT. CANCEL DATE RESPONSIBILITY VENDOR # TERMS
Jan 30, 2024 ARIEL D33 NET 60 DAYS
Comments/Special Instructions: REFERENCE
I QTY
JOB/LOT/COST REFERENCE Description ORDERED UNIT PRICE EXTENSION
067-B06-666 CODE 666 EMBOSSED WHITE SLAB DOOR 1.0000 482.720000 482.72
PRE-FINISHED
067-B06-707 CODE 707 SERVICE CHARGE TO REPLACE 1.0000 175.000000 175.00
Subtotal 657.72
J‘/ HST 85.50
% m——
Ayénzﬁ Signature Total Order Value 743.22

ORDER TERMS AND CONDITIONS

1. INVOICES must bear exact same prices and terms or authorization for changes must be received from our company in writing prior to shipping.
2. The right is reserved to cancel all or part of this order if not delivered within the time specified.
3. Packing slips must accompany all shipments.
4. In the event of interruption of our business in whole or in part by reason of fire, floo
control, we shall have the option of cancelling undelivered orders in whole or in part.

5. Acceptance of this pirchase order, or shipment of it will constitute an agreement to all of its specifications as to terms, delivery and prices.
6. No deliveries accepted after 4:00 pm or on weekends.

d, windstorm,earthquake, war, strike, embargo, acts of God, governmental action, or any causes beyond our

WHITE - ORIGINAL

CANARY - ACCOUNTS PAYABLE

PINK - DEPARTMENT




CREATED: 2024-01-23
LAST MODIFICATION: 2024-01-23

DALMMERN
. Date required: 2024-02-13
Quotation
JOB: BLOCK B UNIT 06
SOLD TO: SHIP TO:
VALECRAFT HOMES (2019) LTD VALECRAFT HOMES LTD
VALECRAFT HOMES (2019) LTD VALECRAFT HOMES LTD
1455 YOUVILLE DRIVE 1455 YOUVILLE DRIVE
SUITE 210 SUITE 210
ORLEANS ONT. ORLEANS ONT.
K1C 627 K1C 627
Telephone: (613)837-1104
ID: 994-27356
ITEM |QTY CODE TYPE OF PRODUCT St
1 1 S Slab Only No Frame: Steel Series 482,72 $
= - Embossed Slab (200) Pre-Finished White
20 Year Warranty, With Vinyl Cap
I[ D Door Slab (32)
= 79" RH Inswing
[ m No Hinges
Handle Hole 2 1/8" + Drill Dead Bolt 2 1/8" @ 5 1/2" C/C Back Set @ 2
IEI 4 3/8"
— 313M4" — Without Additional Handle Choice
Frame Size Energy Star: NFRC | Zone: YES | U-factor:0.79SlI - 0.14
uUs/-P | | DAL-M-16-01295-00001
| TOTAL: 482.72
ITEM |QTY CODE TYPE OF PRODUCT HNTEET
2 1 SERVICE CHARGE (LABOR TO REPLACE) 175.00 $
v/
— " — |
Frame Size
TOTAL: 175.00 $

** All items are viewed from EXTERIOR. ** Dimensions are width X height

By Mec-Inov inc

PAGE 1/ 2



ID: 994-27356
Customer:
Salesman: SUB-TOTAL.: 657.72 %
Service Department
Date: HST (13%) : 85.50 $
N/A (0%) : 0.00 $
T d diti :
erms and conditions TOTAL: o

NET 30 JOURS

THIS QUOTATION IS VALID FOR 30 DAYS

** All items are viewed from EXTERIOR. ** Dimensions are width X height

By Mec-Inov inc
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Purchase Orders

From: Justin Stoll

Sent: Tuesday, January 23, 2024 12:47 PM

To: Purchase Orders

Subject: Fwd: PST7 unit B6 garage door slab

Attachments: signature Contractor service,jpg; BLOCK B UNIT 06.pdf

Canyou write up a po for this please?

Justin Stoll

Site Supervisor
Valecraft 2019 Embrun
613-809-2654

Begin forwarded message:

From: Dalmen - Contractor Service <contractor_service@dalmen.com>
Date: January 23, 2024 at 11:31:15 AM EST

To: Justin Stoll <jstoll@valecraft.com>

Subject: Re: PST7 unit B6 garage door slab

Good morning,

Please see attachment for the slab that damage.
To proceed we will need PO# to put in production
Please advise

thanks

Kevin

On 2024-01-19 7:29 a.m., Justin Stoll wrote:

Good morning, just following up on this

Justin Stoll

Site Supervisor
Valecraft 2019 Embrun
613-809-2654



